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Editorial Review

Amazon.com Review
One of the most splendid achievements of holy architecture anywhere in the world, the Dome of the Rock in
Jerusalem's Old City is sacred to Muslims, Christians, and Jews alike. Its octagonal structure is adorned with
carved marble and brilliantly colored ceramic tile, and its golden dome is the highlight of the city's skyline.
Sumptuous color photography captures the glory of both exterior and interior--glass windows, lush mosaics,
porphyritic columns, and exquisitely detailed carpets. In combination with a bibliography, glossary of Arabic
terms, and scholarly introduction exploring the cultural and religious significance of the building, this book
presents the most comprehensive and satisfying visual documentation of this magnificent structure ever
published.

From Library Journal
A study of Jerusalem's Dome of the Rock, among the holiest of places for Muslims, Christians, and Jews,
this beautiful book combines superb photography and clear, scholarly writing. Grabar (Sch. of Historical
Studies, Inst. for Advanced Studies, Princeton) describes the dimensions and physical attributes of the
building, the beliefs and practices associated with it, and the source of the decorative features. The writing is
supported by the excellent photographs of architectural photographer Nuseibeh, who collaborated on The
Shape of the Holy (Princeton Univ., 1996) with Grabar. Nuseibeh describes the mosaics of the dome,
supplies translations of the inscriptions, and discusses the problems of photographing the area. The volume
brings to life one of the most glorious architectural achievements of the Umayyad dynasty and one that is at
the center of recent conflicts in the region. This volume deserves to be in every public and academic
library.?Martin Chasin, Adult Inst. Bridgeport, Ct.
Copyright 1996 Reed Business Information, Inc.

From Booklist
It is possible to get bogged down in the commentary that accompanies this presentation of one of Jerusalem's
most distinguished buildings. That is too bad. It is possible, also, to be slowed down--indeed, stopped dead in
one's browsing tracks--by Nuseibeh's extremely careful photographs of the place. That is not bad at all. The
Dome of the Rock commemorates many things, including a central Islamic mystical event, the Night Journey
of the prophet Muhammad from Mecca to Jerusalem. On account of this association, it is one of the most
visited sites in Islam. With its shining golden outer dome, richly tiled walls, and mosaic-laden interiors
upheld by gleaming marble columns, it constitutes a treasury of Islamic sacred decor, which is almost
completely nonobjective. Nuseibeh's colorplates afford many closer views of details than could be enjoyed
on the site itself, and perhaps better perspectives and panoramas of the shrine and its surroundings, as well. A
genuinely stunning art book. Ray Olson

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Dorothy Payne:

The book The Dome of the Rock can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about
everything you want. Exactly why must we leave a very important thing like a book The Dome of the Rock?
Several of you have a different opinion about e-book. But one aim that book can give many information for
us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or information that

http://localhost/gp/feature.html/?docId=1000027801


you take for that, you may give for each other; you could share all of these. Book The Dome of the Rock has
simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and big function for you. You can appear the enormous world
by open and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Thelma Price:

Exactly why? Because this The Dome of the Rock is an unordinary book that the inside of the publication
waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will distress you with the secret that inside. Reading this book
close to it was fantastic author who all write the book in such amazing way makes the content interior easier
to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is good for you for not hesitating
having this anymore or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of positive aspects than the other
book have such as help improving your proficiency and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to
delay having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the reserve store hurriedly.

Charles Bryce:

You may spend your free time to see this book this e-book. This The Dome of the Rock is simple to develop
you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not have got much space to
bring the printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save
the book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Amanda Garcia:

This The Dome of the Rock is completely new way for you who has interest to look for some information as
it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you into it getting knowledge more you know otherwise you who
still having bit of digest in reading this The Dome of the Rock can be the light food to suit your needs
because the information inside this book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books acquire itself in the
form and that is reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book type. People who think that in e-book form
make them feel sleepy even dizzy this book is the answer. So there is absolutely no in reading a reserve
especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't miss it!
Just read this e-book type for your better life in addition to knowledge.
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