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Editorial Review

Review
Globalization and Culture: Global Melange discusses issues of race which are often overlooked in wider-
ranging surveys of globalization and its possibilities, offering a more complex analysis that should be
considered key to any political studies course. Cultural challenges involved in blending perspectives,
worldviews and political structures are too often tagged onto the end of a political survey: here, it's at the
forefront, offering an argument that cultural mixing is resulting in a global melange culture and considering
common arguments surrounding hybridization. The result is a 'must' for any considering political and social
global issues. (Midwest Book Review)

Now in a fully revised and updated edition, this seminal text disputes the view that we are experiencing a
“clash of civilizations” as well as the idea that globalization leads to cultural homogenization. Instead, Jan
Nederveen Pieterse argues that we are witnessing the formation of a global mélange culture through
processes of cultural mixing or hybridization. From this perspective on globalization, conflict may be
mitigated and identity preserved, albeit transformed. This historically deep and geographically wide
approach to globalization is essential reading as we face the increasing spread of conflicts bred by cultural
misunderstanding.

About the Author
Jan Nederveen Pieterse is Mellichamp Professor of Global Studies and Sociology at the University of
California, Santa Barbara.

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Milford Garrett:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important act, like looking
for your favorite e-book and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the book entitled Globalization and Culture: Global Mélange. Try to face the book
Globalization and Culture: Global Mélange as your good friend. It means that it can to get your friend when
you feel alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned
for you personally. The book makes you far more confidence because you can know anything by the book.
So , let us make new experience and knowledge with this book.

Cheryl Kirkland:

The book Globalization and Culture: Global Mélange gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time.
You may use to make your capable far more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting
anxiety or having big problem with the subject. If you can make examining a book Globalization and
Culture: Global Mélange to be your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your current capable,
increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. You could know everything if you like open and read
a book Globalization and Culture: Global Mélange. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science



publication or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this guide?

Peggy Young:

The book untitled Globalization and Culture: Global Mélange contain a lot of information on it. The writer
explains the woman idea with easy means. The language is very simple to implement all the people, so do
definitely not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was authored by famous author. The author will bring
you in the new age of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can read more your smart
phone, or product, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-
book, you can available their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice go through.

Steven Delorme:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book ended up
being rare? Why so many query for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some
people likes looking at, not only science book and also novel and Globalization and Culture: Global Mélange
or maybe others sources were given understanding for you. After you know how the fantastic a book, you
feel would like to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher as well as students especially.
Those textbooks are helping them to increase their knowledge. In other case, beside science e-book, any
other book likes Globalization and Culture: Global Mélange to make your spare time much more colorful.
Many types of book like this.
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